Shortlist Notice/ Best Evaluated Bidder Notice
(for Procurement and Disposal Notice Board)

The bidders listed below have been short listed for the procurement requirement detailed below.

Procurement Reference number:

UWEC/PRQ/19-20/00001

Subject of Procurement:

2021-2023

Prequalification of Providers for Supplies, Services & Works for Years

Method of Procurement:

Open Domestic Bidding

NAMES OF SHORTLISTED APPLICANTS:

TABLE 2-SUMMARY OF PRE-QUALIFIED/ SUCCESSFUL PROVIDERS

Subiject of Procurement:

WORKS, SRVCS, SUPPLIES

Category Bidder Name Address Contact
Person/
Position
1.0 SUPPLIES
1.1 Office
stationery
1. Gulf Africa P.O. Box 24742 K’la Uganda Sunir Kumar
Ltd Tel: 0414234017 General
Email: gulfafri@infocom.co.ug Manager
2. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
3. Dopetech Co. Kampala Okello Flavia
Ltd Tel: 0774572835 Chief
Email: info@dopetech.org Executive
Officer
4, Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
5. Graphic P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Trushar
Systems (U) Tel: 0750504503 Upadhyay
Limited Email: gsul@graphicsystems-ea.com Busngesstmt
eal
6. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
7 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
8. Global 7 P.O. Box 34568, Kampala Jighesh Kumar
Limited Tel: 0753443424/ 0789225797 Rajesh Bhai
Email: sales@global7.biz Nayi
Account
Manager




9. Prompt P.O. Box 7352, Kampala Mr. Daxesh
Supply 2011 Tel: 0393264256/ 0414235017 Patel
Ltd Email: info@promptsupply2011.com Director
10. Tesam P.O. Box 2940, Kampala Masagazi
Investments Tel: 0704768462/ 0781460263 Rogers
Ltd Email: tesaminvestments123@gmail.com | Administrator
1.2 Computers,
Printers,
Photocopiers,
Scanners,
Software,
consumables
and
accessories.
1. Service & P.O. Box 2109, Kampala Abbas Syed
Computer Tel: 0414351700/ 0312351700 Haider
Industries (U) | Email: sales@sciug.com/ rohit@sciug.com/ | Head of Sales
Ltd kasule@sciug.com
2. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
3. PC World P.O. Box 3110, Kampala Ameen Jivani
Computers Tel: 0414236247
Ltd Email: info@pcworldcomputers.co.ug
4, Gulf Africa P.O. Box 24742 K’la Uganda Sunir Kumar
Ltd Tel: 0414234017 General
Email: gulfafri@infocom.co.ug Manager
5. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com Manager
Ltd
6. Tenda Africa P.O. Box 26504, Kampala Pontius
Limited Tel: 0704026104 Namugera
Email: info@tendaafrica.com Chief
Executive
Officer
7. Dopetech Co. Kampala Okello Flavia
Ltd Tel: 0774572835 Chief
Email: info@dopetech.org Executive
Officer
8. Kaslex P.O. Box 102539, Kampala Mumbere
Solutions Tel: 0709143131 Brian
Limited Email: sales@kaslexsolutions.com/ Sales &
info@kaslexsolutions.com Technical
Manager
9. Ranx Group P.O. Box 21395, Kampala Sanya Felix
of Companies Tel: 0700601875/ 0783331948 Philip
Limited Email: info@ranxgroup.com Managing

Director



mailto:sales@sciug.com/
mailto:rohit@sciug.com/
mailto:sales@kaslexsolutions.com/

10. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
11 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
12 Computer P.O. Box 34964, Kampala Linda
Revolution Tel: 0414222420 Kwoshaba
Africa (U) Email: info@computer-revolution.co.ug Alinda
Ltd Technical
Manager
13 Global 7 P.O. Box 34568, Kampala Jighesh Kumar
Limited Tel: 0753443424/ 0789225797 Rajesh Bhai
Email: sales@global7.biz Nayi
Account
Manager
14 Trio CEO P.O. Box 9542, Kampala Kyomugisha
Limited Tel: 0772672530/ 0776421883 Caroline
Email: Manager
15 The Copy Cat P.O. Box 12258, Kampala Sahil Patel
Uganda Ltd Tel: Country Head
Email: sales.ug@copycatgroup.com
16 Explore IT P.O. Box 106110, Kampala Andela
Technologies Tel: 0756478477 Upendra
Ltd Email: info@exploreittechnologies.com Kumar
Managing
Director
17 G-Tech P.O. Box 903, Mukono Ocaya Cosmas
Limited Tel: 0752753200 Ochola
Email: admin@gtechlimited.com Managing
Director
18 Intelligent P.O. Box 11069, Kampala Ricky Mugabi
Solutions Tel: 0414673146/ 0702639967 Director
Email: info@isl.ug
19 Technology P.O. Box 7661, Kampala Wycliffe
Associates Ltd Tel: 0752857735/ 0414348741/2 Omondi
Email: naveenp@techno-associates.co.ug Finance
Manager
20 Lakhi Hightech P.O. Box 23592, Kampala Raghunath
Ltd Tel: 0753300051/52/ 0773300051 Kishori Vijay
Email: info@lakhi-hitech.com/ Managing
lakhihightech@gmail.com/ sales@Ilakhi- Director
hightech.com
1.4 Supply and
maintenance of
Generators and
Solar
equipment
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country

Director



mailto:info@lakhi-hitech.com/
mailto:lakhihightech@gmail.com/

2. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
3. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com Manager
Ltd
4. Solar Nation P.O. Box 35597, Kampala Lunkuse
SMC Ltd Tel: 0200966988/ 0777112018 Ssimbwa
Email: info@solarnationug.com Stella
Managing
Director
5. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
6 Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
7 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
8 Davis & P.O. Box 22824, Kampala Patrick
Shirtliff Tel: 0741783345/ 0704384849 Mufwoya
Email: Managing
Director
9 City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
1.5 Printers,
Printer
consumables
and accessories
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2. Service & P.O. Box 2109, Kampala Abbas Syed
Computer Tel: 0414351700/ 0312351700 Haider
Industries (U) | Email: sales@sciug.com/ rohit@sciug.com/ | Head of Sales
Ltd kasule@sciug.com
3. Kaslex P.O. Box 102539, Kampala Mumbere
Solutions Tel: 0709143131 Brian
Limited Email: sales@kaslexsolutions.com/ Sales &
info@kaslexsolutions.com Technical
Manager
4 PC World P.O. Box 3110, Kampala Ameen Jivani
Computers Tel: 0414236247
Ltd Email: info@pcworldcomputers.co.ug



mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/
mailto:sales@sciug.com/
mailto:rohit@sciug.com/
mailto:sales@kaslexsolutions.com/

5. Gulf Africa P.O. Box 24742 K’la Uganda Sunir Kumar
Ltd Tel: 0414234017 General
Email: gulfafri@infocom.co.ug Manager
6. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com Manager
Ltd
7. Ranx Group P.O. Box 21395, Kampala Sanya Felix
of Companies Tel: 0700601875/ 0783331948 Philip
Limited Email: info@ranxgroup.com Ma_magmg
Director
8. Global 7 P.O. Box 34568, Kampala Jighesh Kumar
Limited Tel: 0753443424/ 0789225797 Rajesh Bhal
Email: sales@global7.biz Nayi
Account
Manager
10. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
11. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
12 Computer P.O. Box 34964, Kampala Linda
Revolution Tel: 0414222420 Kwoshaba
Africa (U) Email: info@computer-revolution.co.ug Alinda
Ltd Technical
Manager
13 Trio CEO P.O. Box 9542, Kampala Kyomugisha
Limited Tel: 0772672530/ 0776421883 Caroline
Email: Manager
14 The Copy Cat P.O. Box 12258, Kampala Sahil Patel
Uganda Ltd Tel: Country Head
Email: sales.ug@copycatgroup.com
15 Explore IT P.O. Box 106110, Kampala Andela
Technologies Tel: 0756478477 Upendra
Ltd Email: info@exploreittechnologies.com Kumar
Managing
Director
16 G-Tech P.O. Box 903, Mukono Ocaya Cosmas
Limited Tel: 0752753200 Ochola
Email: admin@gtechlimited.com Managing
Director
17 Intelligent P.O. Box 11069, Kampala Ricky Mugabi
Solutions Tel: 0414673146/ 0702639967 Director
Email: info@isl.ug
18 Technology P.O. Box 7661, Kampala Wycliffe
Associates Ltd Tel: 0752857735/ 0414348741/2 Omondi
Email: naveenp@techno-associates.co.ug Finance
Manager
19 Lakhi Hightech P.O. Box 23592, Kampala Raghunath
Ltd Tel: 0753300051/52/ 0773300051 Kishori Vijay
Email: info@lakhi-hitech.com/ Managing
lakhihightech@gmail.com/ sales@lakhi- Director

hightech.com



mailto:info@lakhi-hitech.com/
mailto:lakhihightech@gmail.com/

1.6 Air
Conditioners
and
Accessories
1. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com Manager
Ltd
2. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
3 Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
4 Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
5 Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
6 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
7 City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
1.7 Office
Equipment and
Tools
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2. City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
1.3 | Motor vehicles
and
Motorcycles
1. Tyre Express P.O. Box 34962, Kampala Surendra Babu
(V) Lid Tel: 0414661865/ 0751306838 Sales Head
Email: sales@tyreexp.com
2. CFAO P.O. Box 31732, Kampala Pieter
Motors Tel: 0312301600 Overbeck
Uganda Email: cfaomotors.ug@cfao.com General
Limited Manager



mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/
mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/

1.4 Office
furniture &
Fitting/
Interior
designing/
Partition
1. Nina Interiors P.O. Box 16388, Kampala Juliana
Ltd Tel: 0414233379 Kagimu
Email: info@ninainteriors.co.ug/ Mukasa
sales@ninainteriors.co.ug Director
2. Vee Gallery P.O. Box 26092, Kampala Ssebuuma
Limited Tel: 0774240609 Ibrahim
Email: veegalleryltd@gmail.com Managing
Director
3. Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
4 Nila Mult P.O. Box 107435, Kampala Namuli
Concepts Ltd Tel: 0705347400 Priscilla
Email: nilamultconcepts@gmail.com Managing
Director
5 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
6 Prime Impex P.O. Box 7414, Kampala Shahul
2001 Ltd Tel: 0414341668/ 0414345866 Hameed
Email: info@primeimpex2001.com Finance
Manager
7 Vave P.O. Box 21345, Kampala Kalley
Investments Tel: 0783302997/ 0704925344 Josephine
Limited Email: vaveinvestmentsltd@gmail.com Mutuzo
Director
8 Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
9 Global 7 P.O. Box 34568, Kampala Jighesh Kumar
Limited Tel: 0753443424/ 0789225797 Rajesh Bhai
Email: sales@global7.biz Nayi
Account
Manager
10 Fabrication P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Ketan
System (U) Tel: 0753636329 Dalwade
Ltd Email: info@fabricationsystems.co.ug Manager
11 Footsteps P.O. Box 76399, Kampala Nyangoma
Furniture Co. Tel: 041342057/ 0414342062 Ingrid
Ltd Email: sales@footstepsfurniture.com Sales &
Marketing
Manager
12 Savvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com



mailto:info@ninainteriors.co.ug/

1.5 | Motor vehicle
Accessories/
parts (tyres,
tubes, batteries
and Spare
parts)
1. Tyre Express P.O. Box 34962, Kampala Surendra Babu
(V) Lid Tel: 0414661865/ 0751306838 Sales Head
Email: sales@tyreexp.com
2. Arrow Centre P.O. Box 7353, Kampala Amin Virani
(Uganda) Tel: 0772623079 Director
Limited Email: arrowcentre@yahoo.com
3. Shiv Shakti P.O. Box 23429, Kampala Patel Kalpesh
International Tel: 0704406962/ 0772406962
Ltd Email:
shivshaktiinternational619@gmail.com/
ssiuganda@gmail.com
4. Solar Nation P.O. Box 35597, Kampala Lunkuse
SMC L Tel: 0200966988/ 0777112018 Ssimbwa
Email: info@solarnationug.com Stella
Managing
Director
5. City Tyres P.O. Box 10022, Kampala Hussein
Tel: 0414341715 Ahmed
Email: sales@Ccitytyres.net Director
6. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
7. CFAO P.O. Box 31732, Kampala Pieter
Motors Tel: 0312301600 Overbeck
Uganda Email: cfaomotors.ug@cfao.com General
Limited Manager
8. Savvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
1.6 General
supplies such
as, cleaning
equipment,
sanitary bins &
materials
toiletries and
hygiene.
1 A&M P.O. Box 24710, Kampala Lydia
Executive Tel: 0772701547 Munyaniza
Cleaning Email: info@amcleaning.org
Services Co.
Ltd
2. Brand Care P.O. Box 4352, Kampala Jonathan
Tel: 0757586713 Grace
Email: sales@brandcare.org/ Kakembo
Opreations

design@brandcare.org

Manager



mailto:shivshaktiinternational619@gmail.com/
mailto:sales@brandcare.org/

3. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
4, Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
5. Cleanifield P.O. Box 113019, Kampala Ronald Kasule
Enterprises Tel: 0700809091 Managing
Limited Email: cleanfieldent@gmail.com Director
6. Crestanks P.O. Box 11381, Kampala Ajay Kumar
Tel: 0750766580/ 0706998506 Jain
Email: info@crestanks.co.ug General
Manager
7. Kiggundu P.O. Box 3894, Kampala Kigundu
Thomas Tel: 0705180630/ 0772640557/ 0701954545 Thomas
Suppliers Email: tom-kiggundu@yahoo.com Director
SLO-
Explosion
1.7 | Food stuffs and
Wood Fuel
1. Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
2. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
3. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
4. Kiggundu P.O. Box 3894, Kampala Kigundu
Thomas Tel: 0705180630/ 0772640557/ 0701954545 Thomas
Suppliers Email: tom-kiggundu@yahoo.com Director
SLO-
Explosion
5 Savvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
1.8 Drugs,
laboratory
equipment,
reagents,
chemicals and
medical
sundries
1. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
2. Medipro P.O. Box 6441, Kampala Mbawa Sylvia
Diagnostics Tel: 0393252136/ 0782069765 Donee
Ltd Email: mediprodiagnostics@gmail.com
3. Standard P.O. Box 10444, Kampala James Mukulu
Medical Tel: 0200906826 Director
Supplies Co. Email: admin@standardmedical.co.ug/
Ltd ugstandardmedical@gmail.com



mailto:admin@standardmedical.co.ug/

4, Bio Scientific P.O. Box 103803, Kampala Unasi Patricia
Investments Tel: Donee
Ltd Email: bioscientificinvestments@gmail.com
5. Africa Bio P.O. Box 8644, Kampala John Mwakio
Systems Tel: 0772585211 Chief
Uganda Ltd Email: info@africabiosystem.com Commercial
Officer
6. Zake P.O. Box 21563, Kampala Nabukko
International Tel: 0704562364/ 0772449005 Sharifah
Group Email: zakeint.group@gmail.com Managing
Limited Director
7. Chemmart P.O. Box 12784, Kampala Mbabazi
Uganda Ltd Tel: 0774088268 Tuyisabe Biz
Email: info@chemmartug.com Managing
Director
8. Abacus P.O. Box 31376, Kampala Rajesh B.
Pharma (A) Tel: 0712919100 Khanna
Ltd Email: rajesh.bonthala@abacuspharma.com
9. City Medicals P.O. Box 35220, Kampala Hannington
Limited Tel: 0414240158 Byarugaba
Email: contracts@citymedicals.org Executive
Director
10. Palin P.O. Box 37689, Kampala Richard Ngeze
Corporation Tel: 0414285078 Kizito
Limited Email: info@palineurope.com Sales
Administrator
11 Octopus P.O. Box 30491, Kampala Mwanje Brian
Medical Tel: 0702359059/ 0779147999/ 0200955520 Managing
Solution Email: octopusmedica@gmail.com Director
1.9 | Agricultural
Inputs and
Animal Feeds
1. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
2. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
3. Kiggundu P.O. Box 3894, Kampala Kigundu
Thomas Tel: 0705180630/ 0772640557/ 0701954545 Thomas
Suppliers Email: tom-kiggundu@yahoo.com Director
SLO-
Explosion
1.10| Promotional
Materials
1. Dataline P.O. Box 11871, Kampala Kasirye Jamil
Graphics Tel: 0776773004 Kyagaba
Email: info@datalinegraphics.co.ug Director
Marketing
2. New Vision P.0.Box 9815 K’la Uganda Hope
Printing & Tel: 0774326613/ 0751026886 Nuwagaba
Printing Email: tnamalwa@newvision.co.ug
Company Ltd
(Vision

Group)




1.11 Petroleum
products i.e.
Fuel and
Lubricants
1. No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.12 | Fire fighting
equipment and
Spares
1. Fire Masters P. O. Box 3887, Kampala Martin Ray
Ltd Tel: 0772689336/ 0750073014 Strokes
Email: info@firemasters.co.ug Accounts
Assistant
1.13 Electrical/
Electronic
equipment and
accessories
1. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
2. Dutch P.O. Box 8707, Kampala Deo
Engineering Tel: 0713508855/ 0775927124 Lukyamuzi
Ltd Email: dutchengineeringltd@gmail.com
3. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
4, Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
5. Ranx Group P.O. Box 21395, Kampala Sanya Felix
of Companies Tel: 0700601875/ 0783331948 Philip
Limited Email: info@ranxgroup.com Managing
Director
6. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
7. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
8. Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
9. Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
10. City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director

Repair Ltd



mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/

1.14 Uniforms,
Curtains,
protective wear
and Carpets
1. Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
2. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
3. Graphic P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Trushar
Systems (U) Tel: 0750504503 Upadhyay
Limited Email: gsul@graphicsystems-ea.com Bus'gizsdun't
4. Dataline P.O. Box 11871, Kampala Kasirye Jamil
Graphics Tel: 0776773004 Kyagaba
Email: info@datalinegraphics.co.ug Director
Marketing
5. Nila Mult P.O. Box 107435, Kampala Namuli
Concepts Ltd Tel: 0705347400 Priscilla
Email: nilamultconcepts@gmail.com Managing
Director
6. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
7. Vave P.O. Box 21345, Kampala Kalley
Investments Tel: 0783302997/ 0704925344 Josephine
Limited Email: vaveinvestmentsltd@gmail.com 'V_'UtUZO
Director
8 Sawvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
1.15 | Staff welfare
1. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12841, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Operations
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com Manager
1.16 Parts for
Motorcycles
1. No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.17 Building
Materials and
Agricultural
Tools
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2. Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk




3. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
4. Dutch P.O. Box 8707, Kampala Lukyamuzi
Engineering Tel: 0784579432/ 0713508855 Deo
Limited Email: dutchengineering@gmail.com Director
5. Reintec P.O. Box 5833, Kampala Nurein Al
Engineering Tel: 0751010103/ 0776369103 Nabhani
Company Email: reintecengineering@gmail.com Director
Limited
6 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
7 Katgo P.O. Box 7579, Kampala Katangaza
Construction Tel: 0701437026/ 0772437027 Godfrey
Co. Lid Email: katgoco.89@gmail.com/ Managing
katgoco89@gmail.com Director
8 Crestanks P.O. Box 11381, Kampala Ajay Kumar
Tel: 0750766580/ 0706998506 Jain
Email: info@crestanks.co.ug General
Manager
9 Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
10 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
11 Savvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
1.18 Security
Gadgets
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2 Tenda Africa P.O. Box 26504, Kampala Pontius
Limited Tel: 0704026104 Namugera
Email: info@tendaafrica.com Chief
Executive
Officer
3 Leverage P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
Worldwide Tel: 0772493779/ 0702952884 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@yahoo.co.uk
4 Ranx Group P.O. Box 21395, Kampala Sanya Felix
of Companies Tel: 0700601875/ 0783331948 Philip
Limited Email: info@ranxgroup.com Managing
Director
5 Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
1.19 Packaging
Bags & FAQ

Polythene Bags



mailto:katgoco.89@gmail.com/

1 Ice Cube P.O. Box 12891, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Director
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com
1.20 Pipes,
Plumbing
materials and
Fittings
1. Dopetech Co. Kampala Okello Flavia
Ltd Tel: 0774572835 Chief
Email: info@dopetech.org Executive
Officer
2. Ice Cube P.O. Box 12841, Kampala Luwaga Siraj
International Tel: 0772449079/ 0758815376 Operations
Ltd Email: luwagas@gmail.com Manager
3. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
4 Crestanks P.O. Box 11381, Kampala Ajay Kumar
Tel: 0750766580/ 0706998506 Jain
Email: info@crestanks.co.ug General
Manager
5 Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
6 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
7 Davis & P.O. Box 22824, Kampala Patrick
Shirtliff Tel: 0741783345/ 0704384849 Mufwoya
Email: Managing
Director
1.21 Processed
Drinking
Water
1. Aqua Coolers P. O. Box 2493, Kampala Y.P Taneja
Ltd Tel: 0780334262/ 0703334262
Email: info@aquacoolersug.com
2.0 SERVICES
2.1 | Printing, Art,
Design,
Photocopy and
Binding
services
1. New Vision P.O. Box 9815 K’la Uganda Hope
Printing & Tel: 0772436902 Nuwagaba
Publishing Email: daloka@newvision.co.ug Head of Sales
Company Ltd
2. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country

Director




3. MPK P.O. Box 71576, Kampala Mwebembezi
Graphics Tel: 0772441548 Peter
Email: mpkgraphics2004@yahoo.com Managing
Director
4. Industrial P.O. Box 3783, Kampala Kasande
Graphic Tel: Namara
Systems Email: info@igsl.co.ug/ talemwa@igsl.co.ug Managing
Limited Director
5. Graphic P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Trushar
Systems (U) Tel: 0750504503 Upadhyay
Limited Email: gsul@graphicsystems-ea.com Bu5||rj|esstn|t
ea
6. Kaslex P.O. Box 102539, Kampala Mumbere
Solutions Tel: 0709143131 Brian
Limited Email: sales@kaslexsolutions.com/ Sales &
info@kaslexsolutions.com Technical
Manager
7. Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
8. George Mary P.O. Box 111112, Wakiso Kayaga
Printers & Tel: 0759803467 Margaret
General Email: georgemery744@mail.com Director
Supplies Ltd
9. Digiprint P.O. Box 28252, Kampala Harriet Hope
Systems (U) Tel: 0782515161/ 0754800109 Account
Ltd Email: sales@digiprintuganda.com/ Manager
nalani@digiprint.biz
10. Dataline P.O. Box 11871, Kampala Kasirye Jamil
Graphics Tel: 0776773004 Kyagaba
Email: info@datalinegraphics.co.ug Director
Marketing
11 Vave P.O. Box 21345, Kampala Kalley
Investments Tel: 0783302997/ 0704925344 Josephine
Limited Email: vaveinvestmentsltd@gmail.com Mutuzo
Director
12 Viryn P.O. Box 70064, Kampala Irene
Enterprises Tel: 0752600444/ 0784695982 Namugisha
Ltd Email: virynenterprises@gmail.com Lyazi
Director
13 Nairo Plot 19/20 Nkrumah Road, Kampala Mugabi
Agencies Ltd Tel: 0775554075 Shidah
Email: nairoagencies4@gmail.com Director
14 TTB P.O. Box 21325, Kampala Edward
Investments | Tel: 0782888888/ 0772310443/ 0772200095 Kakembo
Ltd Email: tthinvestments@yahoo.com/ Nsubuga
info@ttbinvestments@yahoo.com Chief
Operating
Officer
15 Savvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
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2.2

Servicing,
Maintenance &
repair of office

tools &
equipment e.g.
Computers
1. Service & P.O. Box 2109, Kampala Abbas Syed
Computer Tel: 0414351700/ 0312351700 Haider
Industries (U) | Email: sales@sciug.com/ rohit@sciug.com/ | Head of Sales
Ltd kasule@sciug.com
2. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
3. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com Manager
Ltd
4. Tenda Africa P.O. Box 26504, Kampala Pontius
Limited Tel: 0704026104 Namugera
Email: info@tendaafrica.com Chief
Executive
Officer
5 Kaslex P.O. Box 102539, Kampala Mumbere
Solutions Tel: 0709143131 Brian
Limited Email: sales@kaslexsolutions.com/ Sales &
info@kaslexsolutions.com Technical
Manager
6 Ranx Group P.O. Box 21395, Kampala Sanya Felix
of Companies Tel: 0700601875/ 0783331948 Philip
Limited Email: info@ranxgroup.com Managing
Director
7 Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
8 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director
Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
9 Computer P.O. Box 34964, Kampala Linda
Revolution Tel: 0414222420 Kwoshaba
Africa (U) Email: info@computer-revolution.co.ug Alinda
Ltd Technical
Manager
10 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
11 Trio CEO P.O. Box 9542, Kampala Kyomugisha
Limited Tel: 0772672530/ 0776421883 Caroline
Email: Manager
12 The Copy Cat P.O. Box 12258, Kampala Sahil Patel
Uganda Ltd Tel: Country Head

Email: sales.ug@copycatgroup.com
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13 G-Tech P.O. Box 903, Mukono Ocaya Cosmas
Limited Tel: 0752753200 Ochola
Email: admin@gtechlimited.com Managing
Director
14 Intelligent P.O. Box 11069, Kampala Ricky Mugabi
Solutions Tel: 0414673146/ 0702639967 Director
Email: info@isl.ug
15 Technology P.O. Box 7661, Kampala Wycliffe
Associates Ltd Tel: 0752857735/ 0414348741/2 Omondi
Email: naveenp@techno-associates.co.ug Finance
Manager
16 City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
2.3 Insurance
services/
Brokerage
1. The Statewide P.O. Box 9393, Kampala Jaggwe
Insurance Tel: 0752262119 Ronald
Company Ltd Email: swico@swicoug.com/ Muyingo.
Swico@swico.co.ug Supervisor
Marketing
Department
2. Clarkson P.O. Box 2308, Kampala Babirye
Insurance- Tel: 0414235499/ 0312202210 Agmela
Insurance Email: info@clarksonug.co.ug General
Brokerage Manager
3 Stallion P.O. Box 40009, Kampala James Odera
Insurance Tel: 0393224055 Managing
Brokers- Email: info@stallion.co.ug Director
Insurance
Brokerage
4 Pax Insurance P.O. Box 7030, Kampala John
Company Tel: 0414233096/89/ 0312266163 Ssempeera
Limited Email: info@paxinsurance.co.ug Chief
Executive
Officer
5 Minet Uganda P.O. Box 3123, Kampala Caroline
Insurance Tel: 0312229200/ 0200529200 Athiyo
Brokers Email: info@minet.co.ug/ bhd@minet.co.ug Director
Limited-
Insurance
Brokerage
2.4 | Motor vehicle
& Motor Cycle
servicing,
repair and
maintenance
(Mechanical
Works)
1. Entebbe P.O. Box 809, Entebbe Kaggwa Tom
Central Tel: 0783809718/ 0782357820 Director

Garage
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2. Bab’s P. O. Box 1475, Kampala Babu Ismail
Transporters Tel: 0752786728 Managing
Email: babsmechanics@gmail.com Director
3. Walusimbi’s P. O. Box 1148, Kampala James
Garage Tel: 0414597797 Walusimbi
Limited Email: info@walusimbisgarage.co.ug Director
4. Bep Auto P. O. Box 700175, Entebbe Mukiibi
Garage Tel: 0784874309/ 0703663930 Emmanuel
Limited Email: bepautogarageltd@gmail.com Managing
Director
5. CFAO P.O. Box 31732, Kampala Pieter
Motors Tel: 0312301600 Overbeck
Uganda Email: cfaomotors.ug@cfao.com General
Limited Manager
2.5 Servicing of
generators, air
conditioners
and
refrigerators
1. Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
2. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
3 Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
4 City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
2.6 Cleaning,
Fumigation
and compound
cleaning
services,
Garbage
collection &
Disposal
1. T&D P.O. Box 10146, Kampala Tayebwa
Cleaners Tel: 0708548992/ 0789973064 Daniel
Limited Email: info@tdcleaners.com Mé}”agmg
Director
2. A&M P.O. Box 24710, Kampala Lydia
Executive Tel: 0772701547 Munyaniza
Cleaning Email: info@amcleaning.org
Services Co.

Ltd



mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/

3. Cleanifield P.O. Box 113019, Kampala Ronald Kasule
Enterprises Tel: 0700809091 Managing
Limited Email: cleanfieldent@gmail.com Director
4 Dag & P.O. Box 27518, Kampala Kaweesa
Bragan Tel: 0782495430 Christopher
Limited Email: info@daganbragan.com Managing
Director
5 Sawvy P.O. Box 114784, Kampala Muda Sadiiq
Investments Tel: 0774841355/ 0702612389/ 0703588833 Secretary
Limited Email: savvyinvestl7@gmail.com
2.7 | Clearing and
forwarding
services
1. No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.8 Courier and
document
delivery
services
No Bid No Bid
2.9 | Air ticketing
services, Tours
& travel
1. Bunyonyi P.O. Box 26905, Kampala Charlotte K
Safaris Ltd Tel: 0773737955/ 0414342482/ Kamugisha.
0312261001/2 Managing
Email:info@bunyonyi.com Director
2. Explore P.O. Box 33257, Kampala Kiiza Doreen.
Travel Tel: 0703730219 Managing
Services Email:doreen@exploretravelug.com Director
3. Satguru Plot No. 30 Pulickal Airport Hotel, Entebbe | Marish Mathur
Travel & Tel: 0759700550/ 0750621340 Country
Tour Services Email: mukesh.saini@satgurutravel.com/ Manager
Company sales.ebb3@satgurutravel.com
Limited
4. Travel Log P.O. Box 24757, Kampala Manju Joe
Tel: 0414349965/ 6/ 0755838470 General
Email: traveloglimited@hotmail.com Manager
2.10 Auctioning
services
1. No Bid No Bid
2.11 | Firefighting
equipment
servicing
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2 Webs Home P.O. Box 6960, Kampala Mumanyire
Centre Tel: 0782506642 Director

Email: jmumanyire@yahoo.com
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3 Fire Masters P. O. Box 3887, Kampala Martin Ray
Ltd Tel: 0772689336/ 0750073014 Strokes
Email: info@firemasters.co.ug Accounts
Assistant
2.12 Security
services
No Bid No Bid
2.13 Survey
services
1. Future P.O. Box 33111, Kampala Rachel Kimani
Properties Tel: 0755484451/ 0707444403
Consultant- Email: rachel.kimani@t-arch.com
Surveying
2.14 | Consultancy
services i.e.
Human
resource,
Finance,
Investment,
Legal,
Accounting,
auditing &
bookkeeping,
Taxation,
Architectural,
Engineering,
Surveying,
Urban
planning &
landscape
architectural,
Medical, Para-
medical &
Dental,
Veterinary,
Agricultural,
Business,
Recruitment,
ICT Services.
1. Armstrong P.O. Box 22409, Kampala Eng. Kenneth
Consulting Tel: 0414505621/ 0779399214 Magembe
Engineers Email: armstrong@armstrong.co.ug Director
Ltd-
Architectural
&
Engineering
2. Deluxe P.O. Box 6120, Kampala Kyambadde
Computers Tel: 0392178023/ 0754680968 Patrick
Enterprises Email: deluxe-computers@rocketmail.com
Ltd- ICT

Services




3. City Medicals P.O. Box 35220, Kampala Dr.
Limited- Tel: 0414240158 Hannington
Medical, Email: contracts@citymedicals.org Byaruhanga
Para-medical Executive
& Dental Director
4. Shonubi Kampala Noah Edwin
Musoke & Co. Tel: 0752694005 Mwesigwa
Advocates- | Email: nmwesigwa@shonubimusoke.co.ug Managing
Legal Partner
5. Tenda Africa P.O. Box 26504, Kampala Pontius
Limited- ICT Tel: 0704026104 Namggera
Services Email: info@tendaafrica.com Chief
Executive
Officer
6. Strategic P.O. Box 9671, Kampala Kosea
Friends Tel: 0752321435 Wambaka
International Email: info@sfi.co.ug Head of Party
& Programs
7. Birungi Barata P. O. Box 21086, Kampala Birungi
& Associates- Tel: 0414348669 Cephas
Legal Email: birungi@taxconsultants.co.ug Kagyenda
Managing
Partner
8. Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited- Director
Engineering
9. Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd- Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
Engineering
10. Spark Talent P.O. Box 7381, Kampala Kivumbye
Solutions Ltd- Tel: 0753366930/ 0705321518/ 0750383523 Samuel Edwin
Recruitment Email: recruitment@sparktalentsolutions.com Business
& Training Development
Officer
11 BDO East P.O. Box 9113, Kampala Kenneth
Africa Tel: 0700200770/ 0788158444 Makanga
Advisory Email: info@bdo-ea.com/ uganda@bdo-ea.com Managing
Services (U) Partner
Ltd-
Accounting,
auditing,
bookkeeping,
Taxation &
Business
2.15 Facilities

maintenance
minor repairs-
electrical
(servicing &
maintenance),
plumbing,
painting
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1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2. Synametric P.O Box 12237, Kampala Katende
Systems Ltd Tel: 0782416993/ 0704585270 Muhamud
Email: sales@synametric.co.ug Manager
Finance &
Administration
3. Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
4 Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
2.16 Transport
services/
Transportation
(short and long
haulage)
1. Bunyonyi P.O. Box 26905, Kampala Charlotte K
Safaris Ltd Tel: 031226100/1/2/ 0773737955/ Kamugisha.
0414342482/ 0312261001/2 Managing
Email:info@bunyonyi.com Director
2.17 Catering
Services-Hire
of Canteen
1. Haiba Events P. O. Box 11655, Kampala Ephrance
Ltd Tel: 0778551422 Nsalasatta
Email: nsalasatta@gmail.com/ Director
tuzindejohn@gmail.com
2 Syra P. O. Box 27659, Kampala Siraje
Investments Tel: 0759531618 Wamimbi
Limited Email: sirajew@yahoo.com General
Manager
2.18 | Advertising
and Media
1. Godka Kawuku-Entebbe Road Tugume
Technologies Tel: 0753171457/ 0774510007 Boniface
Ltd Email: pricingdesk@godkatech.com Country
Director
2. Brand Care P.O. Box 4352, Kampala Jonathan
Tel: 0757586713 Grace
Email: sales@brandcare.org/ Kakembo
design@brandcare.org Opreations
Manager
3 Zeus The P.O. Box 109417, Kampala Jeffrey Amani
Agency Tel: 0773180372 Chief
Executive

Email: jeff@zeustheagency.com

Officer
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4 Metropolitan Kampala Muvumba
Republic Tel: 0785800411 Josephine
Uganda Email: Managing
jmuvumba@metropolitanrepublicuganda.com Director
2.19 Health
Services/
Insurance
No Bid No Bid
2.20 Hotel &
Conference
facilities
1. Brovad Sands P.O. Box 9174, Kalangala Kiyimba
Lodge Tel: 0774334655/ 0705050774 Rashid
Email: brovadsandslodge@gmail.com/ Managing
charles@brovadsandslodge.com Director
2. Satguru Tours P.O. Box 25965, Kampala Marish Mathur
& Travel Tel: 0707500105/ 0750550060
Email: marish.mathur@satgurutravel.com
3. Comfort P.O. Box 10909, Kampala Agaya
Hotel Limited Tel: 0756834747 Caroline
Email: info@comforthotel.co.ug
4. Mada P.O. Box 1553, Kampala Fred Ameny
Holdings (U) Tel: 0434122190/1 Ogwang
Ltd Email: reservations.ug@madahotel.com/ General
resug@madahotels.com Manager
5. Cepha’s Inn P.O. Box 121, Kabale Birungyi
Limited Tel: 0486422097 Cephas
Email: birungyicephas@gmail.com Kagyenda
Managing
Director
6 Fairway P.O. Box 4595, Kampala Samson
Boutique Tel: 0789493088 Ombogo
Hotel Email: info@fairwayhotel.co.ug General
Manager
7 Speke Resort P.O. Box 446, Kampala Amit
& Conference Tel: 0414227111 Sachdeva
Centre Email: sales@spekegroup.com Marketing
Manager
8. Admas Grand P.O. Box 642, Entebbe Samson
Hotel Tel: 0705321141/ 0708677946 Mehari
Email: Weldegebriel
salesandmarketing@admasgrandhotel.com Ch'ef
Executive
Officer
9 Gipir and P.O. Box 75, Pakwach Atwarun Isaac
Labongo Tel: 0770757909 Executive
Safari Lodge Email: Director
Ltd gipirandlabongosafarilodge@gmail.com
10 Uganda Hotel P.O. Box 444, Jinja Christine
and Tourism Tel: 0434121954/ 0392846885 Opika Opoka
Training Email: uhtticrested@gmail.com/ Manager
Institute info@ubhtti.ac.ug

2.21

Motor Vehicle

Hire Services
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1. Bunyonyi P.O. Box 26905, Kampala Charlotte K
Safaris Ltd Tel: 0773737955/ 0414342482/ Kamugisha.
0312261001/2 Managing
Email:info@bunyonyi.com Director
2.22 Engraving
1 Vave P.O. Box 21345, Kampala Kalley
Investments Tel: 0783302997/ 0704925344 Josephine
Limited Email: vaveinvestmentsltd@gmail.com '\/_'UtUZO
Director
2 Fabrication P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Ketan
System (U) Tel: 0753636329 Dalwade
Ltd Email: info@fabricationsystems.co.ug Manager
2.23 Events
management
and Public
Relations
1 Metropolitan Kampala Muvumba
Republic Tel: 0785800411 Josephine
Uganda Email: Managing
jmuvumba@metropolitanrepublicuganda.com Director
2 Peno P. O. Box 28789, Kampala Abaasa Peace
Investments Tel: 0772858821/ 0705039821 Director
Limited Email: penoevents@gmail.com
3.0 WORKS
3.1 | Minor/ Major
Civil works
construction
like bore hole
& wells etc,
general
renovation,
painting,
maintenance of
plumbing
systems,
electrical
installation and
muram roads.
1. Passionate Kampala Masaba Paulo
Events (U) Tel: 0772720169 Managing
SMC Limited Email: passionatevents@yahoo.com/ Director
paulomasaba@yahoo.com
2. Reintec P.O. Box 5833, Kampala Nurein Al
Engineering Tel: 0751010103/ 0776369103 Nabhani
Company Email: reintecengineering@gmail.com Director
Limited
3. Mercury P.O. Box 3636, Kampala Victor
Engineering Tel: 0779175116/ 0702661187 Welikhe
Company Ltd Email: info@mercuryengineering.ug “ga}”agting
Irector
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4, Dutch P.O. Box 8707, Kampala Lukyamuzi
Engineering Tel: 0784579432/ 0713508855 Deo
Limited Email: dutchengineering@gmail.com Director
o. Geo Services P.O. Box 20070, Kampala Lukoma
Limited Tel: 0414272011/ 0774445202 George
Email: geo5660@yahoo.com Technical
Director
6. Katgo P.O. Box 7579, Kampala Katangaza
Construction Tel: 0701437026/ 0772437027 Godfrey
Co. Lud Email: katgoco.89@gmail.com/ Managing
katgoco89@gmail.com Director
1. Tesla P.O. Box 108568, Kampala Abdallah
Technical Tel: 0704645061 Ssenyonjo
Services Email: info@teslatechug.com Technical
Limited Director
8. Fabrication P.O. Box 22631, Kampala Ketan
System (U) Tel: 0753636329 Dalwade
Ltd Email: info@fabricationsystems.co.ug Manager
9. Zeta P.O. Box 108773, Kampala Nanyonga
Engineering Tel: 0705660178 Shamim
Services Ltd Email: zetaengineers@gmail.com Director
10 Davis & P.O. Box 22824, Kampala Patrick
Shirtliff- Tel: 0741783345/ 0704384849 Mufwoya
Electrical Email: Managing
Director
11 G-Tech P.O. Box 903, Mukono Ocaya Cosmas
Limited Tel: 0752753200 Ochola
Email: admin@gtechlimited.com Managing
Director
12 City Harvest P.O. Box 8766, Kampala Asuman
Electrical Tel: 0414671845/ 0701328511/ 0772328511 Bogezi
Installation Email: charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/ Managing
Supply and bogezia@gmail.com Director
Repair Ltd
13 Sumadhura P.O. Box 1205, Kampala K.
Technologies Tel: 0757957176/ 0392772957/ 0752222111 Venkateshwar
Limited-Bore Email: shyam@sumadhura.co.ug/ Reddy
Hole md@sumadhura.co.ug Managing
Director
Date for Display: 17" July 2023
Date for Removal: 28" July 2023

Authorised for display on Procurement and Disposal Notice Board:

Signature:

>5

S S

Name: | Dr. James Musinguzi, PhD

Position: | Executive Director Date: 17" July 2023

Display of this Notice does not constitute an acceptance of the bid described above or the formation of a contract. Bid

acceptance and contract placement shall be in accordance with the Regulations.



mailto:katgoco.89@gmail.com/
mailto:charvestelectricals@hotmail.com/
mailto:shyam@sumadhura.co.ug/

List of unsuccessful Bidders

No

Bidder Name

Reason for being Unsuccessful

1.

WMC Africa Limited

- Attached an expired trading licence (February 2023).

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to
pay social security contributions in Uganda. (Valid
NSSF certificate).

- Did not attach copies of the company’s audited
accounts for the previous two years (financial years
or calendar years) (profit/loss, assets/liabilities) and
any financial data.

Global Link Associates Ltd

- Attached an expired (2021) Income Tax Clearance
Certificate, but also addressed to another entity.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to
pay social security contributions in Uganda. (Valid NSSF
certificate).

- Didn’t attach copy of certificate of registration by NITA-
U for IT supplies & services.

- Did not attach a copy of valid Certificate of registration
from the licenced civil engineers body/ union in uganda
applicable for civil works bidders.

Mazars BRJ

Attached an expired trading licence.

Gex Logistics (U) Ltd

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (Valid NSSF
certificate).

Linksat Technologies (U) Limited

- Attached an expired (2021) NITA-U certificate.
- Attached an expired NSSF certificate.

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC, but addressed to another entity.

Liquid Intelligent Technologies

- Attached an expired (2021) NITA-U certificate.
- Attached an expired NSSF certificate.

Scapes & Surveys Associates

-Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

Parapet Cleaning Services (U)
Limited

Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

Hass Scientific & Medical Supplies
Ltd

- Attached an expired (2022) Income Tax Clearance
Certificate, but also addressed to another entity.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).




10.

Open World Contractors

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

11.

Parity Engineering & Supplies
Limited

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

12.

Kalya Courts Hotel

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

13.

Orbit IT Solutions Limited

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

- Didn’t attach copy of certificate of registration by NITA-
U for IT supplies & services.

14.

Cotuno Company Ltd

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

15.

Vegan Foods Uganda Limited

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).

- Did not attach an Income Tax Clearance Certificate
addressed to UWEC.

16.

Solar Nation SMC Ltd

- Didn’t attach evidence of fulfilment of obligations to pay
social security contributions in Uganda. (No Valid NSSF
certificate).




